

Cerullo, Datte & Wallbillich, P.C.

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

1000
1000
1000
1000

Attn: Ms Gail A Stehr, Secretar
Schuylkill County Tax Collection Committee
c/o Ms. Gail A. Stehr, Secretary
1093 Ridge Road
Klingerstown PA 17941

Account No:

Page: 1
05/07/2010
6169M

Previous Balance	Fees	Expenses	Advances	Payments	Balance
6169-0010000 General/Miscellaneous 0.00	1,262.50	0.00	14.96	0.00	\$1,277.46
6169-0020000 Bylaws 0.00	487.50	0.00	0.00	0.00	\$487.50
<u>0.00</u>	<u>1,750.00</u>	<u>0.00</u>	<u>14.96</u>	<u>0.00</u>	<u>\$1,764.96</u>

ALL ACCRUED CHARGES MAY NOT BE INCLUDED ON THIS STATEMENT

PAYABLE UPON PRESENTATION

VISA AND MASTERCARD ACCEPTED

Attn: Ms Gail A Stehr, Secretar
 Schuylkill County Tax Collection Committee
 c/o Ms. Gail A. Stehr, Secretary
 1093 Ridge Road
 Klingerstown PA 17941

Page: 1
 05/07/2010
 Account No: 6169-0010000M
 Statement No: 1

General/Miscellaneous

		Hours	
03/16/2010	Telephone call with Jack Hurst regarding committee issues and By-laws; Review of By-laws.	0.50	
03/26/2010	Review of proposed By-law Amendment; Telephone call with Jack Hurst regarding By-laws.	0.30	
03/30/2010	Review of meeting minutes; Conference with Jack Hurst regarding By-laws and committee status.	1.20	
04/07/2010	Telephone call with Jack Hurst regarding Tax Collector RFP and related issues; Review of Goodman Legislative Memorandum.	0.20	
04/08/2010	Conference with members of TCC regarding Bylaws and Weighted Vote issue.	1.30	
04/12/2010	Review of Act 32 regarding committee procedures regarding vote and bylaws; Telephone call with Jack Hurst regarding TCC Meeting; E-mail from Jack Hurst and review of various TCC documents; Attend TCC Meeting.	2.70	
04/15/2010	E-mail from Gail Stehr regarding DCED letter and meeting notice; Review and revision of DCED letter; Review of Act 32 Bylaw provision; Exchange e-mail with Gail Stehr regarding DCED letter and notice.	0.20	
04/21/2010	Review of draft Tax Collector RFP; Review of draft Tax Collection Agreement; Attend RFP Committee Meeting in New Ringgold.	3.50	
04/22/2010	E-mail to Jack Hurst regarding RFP Committee Meeting and related issues.	0.20	
	Paul J. Datte	<u>10.10</u>	
	For Current Services Rendered	<u>10.10</u>	<u>1,262.50</u>
03/30/2010	FedEx Mailing		14.96
	Total Advances		<u>14.96</u>
	Total Current Work		1,277.46

Schuylkill County Tax Collection Committee

General/Miscellaneous

Account No:
Statement No:

Page: 2
05/07/2010
6169-0010000M
1

Balance Due

\$1,277.46

ALL ACCRUED CHARGES MAY NOT BE INCLUDED ON THIS STATEMENT

PAYABLE UPON PRESENTATION

VISA AND MASTERCARD ACCEPTED

Attn: Ms Gail A Stehr, Secretar
 Schuylkill County Tax Collection Committee
 c/o Ms. Gail A. Stehr, Secretary
 1093 Ridge Road
 Klingerstown PA 17941

Page: 1
 05/07/2010
 Account No: 6169-0020000M
 Statement No: 1

Bylaws

		Hours	
03/29/2010	Preparation of Notice of By-law Amendment Proposal; E-mail to Jack Hurst regarding By-law Amendments; Complete review of By-laws.	0.70	
04/27/2010	Telephone call with John O'Brien, Lackawanna TCC Solicitor, regarding Bylaw weigted vote issue; Attend Schuylkill TCC Bylaw Committee Meeting.	1.50	
04/28/2010	Exchange e-mail with Jack Hurst and Gail Stehr; Preparation of revised Bylaws; Preparation of Bylaw Committee Memorandum.	1.20	
04/30/2010	Complete preparation of new Bylaws; E-mail to Members of Bylaw Committee regarding new Bylaws.	0.50	
	Paul J. Datte	3.90	
	For Current Services Rendered	3.90	487.50
	Total Current Work		487.50
	Balance Due		<u>\$487.50</u>

ALL ACCRUED CHARGES MAY NOT BE INCLUDED ON THIS STATEMENT

PAYABLE UPON PRESENTATION

VISA AND MASTERCARD ACCEPTED